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Book Descriptions:

Dissertation Manual

It paginates according to University requirements and can be used to generate the Table of
Contents, format the margins, etc. Choose the one appropriate to your dissertation e.g., with or
without notice of copyright. When using the Dissertation Template, all italicized notes must be
deleted and the highlighted text must be personalized. Be sure to remove the grey shading used in
the template to indicate fields where information must be entered. The Dissertation Template and a
version for Wharton Doctoral Dissertations is available below. If you choose to create your own
document, rather than use the Dissertation Template, be sure to follow the guidelines below very
carefully. Nothing may appear in the margin area. Headings may be larger. For enhanced screen
readability, use Arial 10pt, Courier New 10pt, Georgia 11pt, Times New Roman 12 pt, or Verdana
10pt font. For footnotes, figures, citations, charts and graphs, a font of 8 point or larger should be
used. Italic type may be used for quotations, words in a foreign language, occasional emphasis, or
book titles. The title page is counted as page i, and the copyright page if there is one as pageii, but
do not print the page numbers on either of these two pages e.g., in a dissertation with a copyright
notice, the first numbered page is iii; in a dissertation without a copyright notice, the first numbered
page is ii. For the text, use Arabic numbers 1, 2, 3, 4, 5,. starting with page 1 the first page of the
text itself. These may be placed either at the top or the bottom of the page. If you use footnotes, it is
recommended that you print page numbers at the page top. Do not print page numbers, footnotes,
or anything else in the margins. Check pagination carefully. Do not include blank pages. All pages
must have a page number and be accounted for. All words count towards the
total.http://www.kwiaciarnia-eden.pl/userfiles/canon-dc210a-manual.xml
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The abstract, which is normally a single paragraph, consists of four parts the statement of the
problem; the procedure and methods used to investigate the problem; the results of the
investigation; and the conclusions. The abstract is published online by ProQuest in “Dissertation
Abstracts International,” providing information to interested readers about the general content of
the dissertation. The abstract is doublespaced. If you have both a supervisor and cosupervisor, list
the cosupervisor’s name on the line beneath the supervisor’s. Do not include any titles e.g.
“Supervisor” or “Advisor”, as this is indicated by the placement of the names. The names and faculty
titles rank and department of the Dissertation Committee members should be listed on the Title
Page their signatures are not necessary. If you want to use a format for your name that differs from
the current name in the Penn In Touch System e.g., a married name, or a full middle name rather
than a middle initial, contact the Registrar’s Office and provide the necessary documentation to
make that change. A student may have both a Dissertation Supervisor and a Dissertation
CoSupervisor, or two Dissertation CoSupervisors, if that responsibility was shared equally. These
students should use the special Romance Languages or Wharton Dissertation Templates. However,
the author of the dissertation owns and retains the copyright in the dissertation, without further
registration formalities see page 19 for more discussion of copyright options. If you choose to
include a copyright notice in your manuscript, place it on a separate page immediately following the
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Title Page.Footnotes at the bottom of a page should be numbered continuously throughout the
dissertation. Endnotes at the end of a chapter are numbered separately for each chapter i.e., the
first note of each chapter will always be numbered
“1”.http://amoosetracksmanor.com/userfiles/canon-dc310-dvd-camcorder-manual.xml

A bottomofthepage footnote must begin on the same page as the text to which it refers, but it may
continue on a following page if necessary. Nothing may appear in the margin area. It may be a single
alphabetical list by chapters, or an alphabetical list by authors for subject and class of publications.
Page numbers in the bibliography continue the pagination of the text; do not number the
bibliography separately. Follow the instructions in ETD Administrator for attaching supplementary
files. Submit the Permission Letter as a Supplemental File in ETD Administrator. Name the file
“Permission Letter Do Not Publish.” Please see the word version above for more information. Filter
by role Filter by role Please enable JavaScript.For Faculty, Student, Staff The author of this review
will not be able to see this report. Graduation More Resources If not logged in you will be asked to
log in to view the forms. View Forms Defense Notification More Resources Alumni Association
Alumni Success Your support helps ensure a top education for our students. Give Now See our
admissions page to connect with us. Download the file to your desktop and open it from the new
location. Please do not print out the entire manual. Instead, the file will open with a bookmarks
panel on the left; use this feature to navigate to the section of interest and only print the pages you
need. Please upgrade your browser to improve your experience. Apply today and unlock your spirit
of discovery. This document will be published as a product of UAH and as such must reflect the
standards, policies and procedures set forth by the Graduate Council of UAH, as well as those of
external entities that will be involved in its publication. We expect these documents to be reasonably
consistent in style and format, to address any legal and ethical issues related to conducting and
publishing original research, and to adhere to the highest standards of English language, grammar
and readability.

Therefore, the Thesis and Dissertation Manual is provided to assist you. Use the Masters 2008 or the
PHD 2008, depending on your program. The.rar files can be uncompressed with a free program
called WinRAR. If you prefer a freeform template, then this one might not be for you. This is an
organized filestructuredriven template. Check with your department head or graduate advisor. For
more information about graduation requirements and deadlines, please visit the Graduation page of
the Graduate College website. For information about Commencement, please visit the
Commencement website. By continuing to use this site you consent to our use of cookies. To learn
more about how we use cookies, view our Privacy Policy. OK. This is a guide to submitting your
dissertation or doctoral project for the formatting check and final copy. APA Guidelines Dissertation
clearance means not only successful defense, but completion of any required revisions and
submission of the dissertation in its final form to the University library. Ensure you are meeting
deadlines relevant to DEX and related fees. Schedule this appointment at least seven business days
in advance. When you meet with the dissertation clearance representative, bring the following two
items Scanned or faxed copies of original signatures are acceptable. This review does not include
proofreading. Make the changes and reupload. Repeat until all necessary revisions have been made
and the library approves the format. Allow three business days for review of any revised, reuploaded
version of the manuscript. The time frame for completing the entire clearance process will vary
depending on the time of year e.g., allow more time as graduation or other due dates approach, the
extensiveness of problems, responsiveness of the student to initial feedback, etc. You must work
with them separately from Alliant. We do not request copies on your behalf. It will be updated as
needed.
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The most important resource the library offers is your college’s research librarian. You can find
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contact information and helpful research tips Open access to etheses and edissertations ETDs
benefit graduate students, as research can be shared with prospective or current employers, a
valuable career tool. Open access makes research accessible to a global audience and has potential
for increased use and higher impact of your work. Students can incorporate interactive features
such as multimedia, hyperlinks, and supplemental files by using various forms of creative
scholarship. The “Things to Think About Before Writing the Thesis or Dissertation” provides helpful
suggestions about how to start the formatting before you start writing. Presetting your formatting
will ease formattinginduced frustrations in the longterm. The “Paperwork to Complete Your Master’s
Defense and Degree Program” and “Paperwork to Complete Your Master’s Defense and Degree
Program” help with concerns about making sure all paperwork has been turned in when it should
be. Finally, check the graduation and submission deadlines for the semester you wish to graduate.
Make sure you submit your graduation application, defend, submit, and upload your thesis or
dissertation on or before the listed deadline. Reading it will help to answer questions about whether
the theses or dissertation is collaborative it is not, how to choose a style guide, who is responsible
for judging the acceptability of the thesis or dissertation, and so forth. Please read if you are
planning on incorporating such material into your theses or dissertation. Simply click on the
hyperlink and it will lead to a pdf. The sections are presented in the order of how the material must
be presented in your document. We recommend that students compare their document to this
checklist prior to Graduate College format review.

Students may consider it because they want the public record to show they own the work’s
copyright; they want a certificate of registration; or because in successful litigation, works that are
registered with the U.S. Copyright Office may be eligible for attorney’s fees and statutory damage.
Answers to frequently asked copyright questions on the FAQs page. This page is optional, but
encouraged, for students who do not register a copyright. This is the format required for when you
submit your document thesis or dissertation to the Graduate College for review. A copy of the
similarity report must be submitted to the student’s advisory committee at the time of the final
defense, and it will be taken into account when determining the outcome of the defense. If the
student passes their defense, the report shall be attached to the Culminating Experience Results
form before submission to the Graduate College. Note You can only submit your document using
your Rebelmail account. If you are simultaneously logged into other Gmail accounts, you will need to
sign out of them and log in to your Rebelmail account only. You may experience issues with this site.
Please upgrade your browser. Visit our Coronavirus website. The ETD center was launched in 2001
as an online repository for master’s theses and doctoral dissertations produced by students studying
at Ohio institutions. Theses and dissertations submitted for Fall Quarter 2006 and beyond must be
deposited with OhioLINK and filed as ETD’s on OhioLINK’s servers. This handbook is basically a
guide to format, not an exhaustive guide to style or to the process of developing and writing a thesis.
Individual departments or programs may stipulate additional requirements, and, in matters of
format, style, and procedure not specified in this handbook, students should seek the advice of their
thesis directors.

For matters not specified by this handbook, or by departments, you should consult the latest edition
of A Manual for Writers of Term Papers, Theses, and Dissertations by Kate L. Turabian. It should be
followed when departments do not specify a style manual. Other manuals can also be used, such as
the American Psychological Association APA Publication Manual, The Modern Language Association
of America MLA Handbook for Writers of Research Papers, the Chicago Manual of Style, etc. All of
these manuals are available as library reference materials or they may be purchased at most
bookstores. Also, the University Writing Center 031 Dunbar Library sells reasonably priced
minimanuals, which provide basic format and citation information for APA and MLA styles. The
important point to remember is that the thesis must be consistent in both the style employed and the



format selected.This review is intended to minimize the likelihood of thesis rejection after the
deposit deadline. However, it in no way guarantees the acceptability of the final copy. To allow
ample time for completing the final deposit copy, you are advised to arrange for a format check well
in advance of the deposit deadline. Format checks will be done as soon as possible, but please allow
at least two 2 days for completion. One copy of the PDF thesis must be deposited at the OhioLINK
ETD Center by going to not later than 30 days after the end of the semester in which the degree will
be granted due dates are published by the Graduate School and distributed to the departments and
program offices. This final copy should follow the form prescribed in this handbook and should be
carefully produced, free of errors in style, mechanics, and format You will be asked to create a user
account and then provide identifying information about yourself, your department, and your ETD,
and then you will be permitted to upload your pdf thesis to the OhioLINK site.

If you have technical questions about putting your ETD together, converting it to a pdf document, or
submitting it to OhioLINK, you should visit the Student Technology Assistance Center STAC, 240
Paul Laurence Dunbar Library, telephone 937 7752656 for help and assistance. STAC’s facilities are
modern and uptodate, its staff is helpful and professional, its hours of operation offer much
flexibility, and its services are free. The ETD cannot be approved until the Graduate School receives
the signed thesis approval page. The Graduate School reserves the right to refuse, for final deposit,
any thesis that does not meet these requirements. Your final copy must be approved and signed by
the Dean of the Graduate School before your degree will be posted to your academic record. They
are also responsible for making these procedures and regulations known to you. The signatures of
your thesis committee members on the approval sheet certify that the content of your thesis meets
an acceptable standard of scholarship and reflects a level of research, originality, and writing style
appropriate for masters and doctoral candidates. It is the departments responsibility to ensure that
all committee members have appropriate graduate faculty status. You have the ultimate
responsibility for the content, scholarship, and style of your thesis, and for maintaining a high
standard of written expression. If you need editorial assistance, you are responsible for securing it.
Your thesis director and advisory committee members will work with you on thesis content and
scholarship standards. While they may also help you in the composition and construction of the
thesis document itself, please remember that proofreading and other editorial chores are not the
duty of your thesis advisors. Submission and retrieval of thesis format check documents at the
Graduate School, as well as mailing costs, when necessary, are also student responsibilities.

Theses which do not follow the prescribed order will be rejected for improper format. Your name
should be given in full and in all capital letters and must be followed by previous degrees. The date
at the bottom of the page should indicate the year in which your degree will be conferred. The title
should clearly describe the contents of the thesis. If possible, word substitutes should be used for
formulas, symbols, superscripts, Greek letters, and so on. If you are interested in applying to
copyright your thesis or dissertation, you should visit the U.S. Copyright Offices official Website for
information and downloading forms. See sample copyright page at Appendix L. In this case, the ETD
is placed on a secure OhioLINK server. It is not released to an Ohio LINK public server until
approved by the University. Approval sheets are to be prepared by the students and are not supplied
by the Graduate School. The approval sheets may be duplicated, but all signatures on them must be
originals. The approval sheet should conform to the sample in Appendix B Masters or Appendix M
Doctoral. You may submit additional copies of the approval sheet for the Graduate Deans signature
which can be returned to you, as needed. You must come to the Graduate School to reclaim approval
sheets, as they will not be forwarded to you. The approval sheet in the electronic file should have
printed names see sample approval sheets at Appendices B and M but no signatures. The copy
delivered to and retained by the Graduate School must be signed; the copy sent to OhioLINK with
your ETD must not be signed. Doctoral dissertation abstracts should not exceed 350 words. Masters
thesis abstracts should not exceed 150 words. For the format, see the sample in Appendix C. The



sample table of contents, list of figures, and list of tables in Appendices D, E, and F, respectively,
provide examples of suitable formats for those parts of the thesis.

Appendix G provides a suitable sample format for the text of your thesis. Appendix H provides a
sample thesis appendix. Appendix I provides a sample bibliography. While Appendix J represents one
approach, please note that lists of References or Literature Cited formats differ among various
scientific fields. You should check with your thesis advisor, or refer to one of the standardized thesis
preparation manuals for the format which is appropriate to your academic field. Care should be
taken to maintain consistency of style and format throughout the thesis. Supplementary materials
printouts, tables, photographs, questionnaires, etc. must also meet these margin requirements.
Spacing must be consistent throughout. See Appendix G for an example of the recommended layout
and spacing for chapter titles, subheadings, etc. The title page and the approval sheet are counted
as preliminary pages, but they are not to be numbered.Starting with the first page of the text, or
body of the thesis, the remaining pages of the thesis including the bibliography and appendices are
numbered consecutively in Arabic numerals i.e., 1, 2, 3, etc., starting with page number 1 on the
first page of the text.You should view these samples as guidelines to the appropriate style and
format for your thesis. Appendices A through F and K through M are samples of a standardized
Wright State University format which should be followed, in all particulars, when preparing your
thesis. The text of your thesis should conform to the Sample Format for Text Appendix G in terms of
pagination, spacing, and structure. The appendices and bibliography or references should conform
to the samples at Appendices H, I, and J. Footnoting and the displaying of tables and figures may
vary, depending on the style manual used or recommended by your department or program e.g.,
Turabian, APA, MLA, Chicago, etc.. Dayton, OH 45435 USA 9377751000. The University has
acquired an enterprisewide license for Zoom.

If you have not received an invitation from Fordham IT to sign up for your Zoom account, please
contact Fordham IT as soon as possible at 7188173999 to activate and utilize your account.
Exceptions to this must be requested in advance and will be subject to Deans approval. If a
document requires a signature, it must be submitted in an email sent from the senders fordham.edu
account. The defense paperwork will be made available on the GSAS website by Monday, as writable
pdfs with the ability to add electronic signature. Click on the signature area to receive instructions
regarding how to set up an electronic signature. The form will be signed on the committee members
behalf by the Deans office. Fordham is my school. TM. Realtime, chat reference service is provided
by reference staff from various academic libraries. UC Irvine librarians will follow up with additional
information if needed. Theses and dissertations may be submitted electronically via ProQuest , or on
paper; electronic submission best serves the majority of our graduate students and is highly
encouraged. In addition to providing detailed information about proper formatting, the manual
details the submission process and provides sample pages and templates. How to request a critique
depends on proximity to the September 9th filing deadline Please plan accordingly; we respond to
questions as they come in and cannot rush or expedite any reviews. The slide deck from previous
workshops is available to view here, complete with speaker notes. Browns electronic theses and
dissertation ETD system was developed by the Graduate School and the University Library and
launched in 2008. The system collects and archives final dissertations as textbased PDF files.
Electronic dissertations submitted through the ETD will appear in the Librarys discovery service and
in the Brown digital repository. A request to restrict download access to a dissertation has an initial
twoyear window from the time the degree is conferred.

Guidelines associated with restricted dissertation access are Requests for additional twoyear
restrictions should be made to the Graduate School. To use the ETD system, doctoral candidates
must possess a valid username and password for accessing Brown’s computer network.Deadline
September 11, 2020 Deadline January 15, 2021 Deadline April 1, 2021 See Submission of the Final



Copy for important clarifications regarding the final submission process. Students may file their
dissertations at any time of the year in advance of the filing deadline. Students may choose to
request a Certificate of Completion to show that they have completed all degree requirements before
beginning a position, as faculty or postdoctoral fellow, for example. See details below under
Certificate of Completion. Students must file before the first day of classes in semester II in order to
avoid being charged the tuition and fees for semester II. At least two weeks prior to the final
examination or defense, candidates must provide the department manager with the appropriate
dissertation defense information so the dissertation defense information form can be completed and
returned to the Graduate School. Candidates must submit final copies of their dissertations
electronically. The signature page should bear the signatures of the dissertation director and all
readers. The typed names of the director and readers must appear under their signature lines.
Electronic signatures are acceptable. An unsigned copy of the signature page should be uploaded to
ETD system. All text should be doublespaced, except for block quotations, captions, long headings,
and footnotes. All these should be singlespaced with a blank line between items. The number should
not appear on the title page or the copyright page but, these pages are assigned numbers and are
included in the pagination.

Preliminary pages are numbered with lower case roman numerals, centered at the foot of the page,
threefourths of an inch from the bottom edge. The title page counts as page i but the number does
not appear on the page. The remainder of the dissertation is numbered with Arabic numerals
beginning with 1. The preliminary pages must appear in the following order The preliminary pages
should appear in this order but not necessarily with the page numbers shown above. Use them only
as appropriate to indicate major sections of the thesis e.g., INTRODUCTION, CHAPTER 1,
BIBLIOGRAPHY. They should be centered and placed two inches from the top of the paper in
uppercase type. Please do not include date or place of birth or phone numbers. The abstract should,
in a concise manner, present the problem of the dissertation, discuss the materials and procedure or
methods used, and state the results or conclusions. Mathematical formulas, diagrams, and other
illustrative materials should be avoided. The abstract should not be part of the dissertation itself nor
should it be included in the table of contents. The abstract should be presented in two unnumbered
loose copies. It should be headed as follows The abstract should be doublespaced and may not
exceed 350 words maximum 2,450 typewritten characters — including spaces and punctuation —
about 70 characters per line with a maximum of 35 lines. Dissertations may require revision after
their original presentation if it is determined by the Graduate School that the dissertation does not
conform to the standards articulated above. The need for such revisions is not grounds for a
deadline extension. If a dissertation is determined to be defective after the deadline, the Graduate
School may refuse to confer a students degree.The online submission system will send notifications
when each document has been received and approved by the Graduate School. Since 1954, the
Graduate School has required that dissertations be published.

In 1985, the Graduate Council reaffirmed that decision and approved the following policy Six months
will be allowed for the clearing of a patent. Otherwise, the name that will appear on the diploma and
in the Commencement program, and under which the Library will catalog the dissertation, is the
name under which the candidate is officially registered. Any request for a change of registered name
should be addressed to the Office of the Registrar and accompanied by supporting legal
documentation, such as a court order, marriage license, passport, driver’s license, or social security
card. Email Our People Introduction This page assists graduate students in successfully creating and
depositing their dissertation or thesis. While these guidelines provide a detailed description of thesis
and dissertation formatting, they also serve as a general discussion of how to construct the
document and how to prevent common formatting mistakes. All guidelines are approved by the
Graduate Council and can be modified at any time however the Graduate School will ensure the
changes are clearly communicated to the faculty and students. Choosing a Style The student must



choose a style for the document early in their graduate career. Style refers to the layout of text,
paragraphs, tables and legends, as well as the formatting and layout of cited literature. Any
published style guideline may be followed; however, it is customary for particular disciplines to write
using particular styles. For example, many workers in the humanities use the style guidelines of the
American Psychological Association or follow The Chicago Manual of Style. Scientific and
professional societies vary widely in the approved format, any of which may be suitable here. Some
advisers may not necessarily state a style preference while others require a particular style.
Students are obligated to follow a particular style if required by their graduate adviser.

If a graduate adviser requires a particular style, the adviser must provide sufficiently detailed
guidelines to the student. If the graduate adviser does not require a particular style, the student is
urged to select from the styles listed above or choose a style of a journal within the discipline. Often,
journals will have “Instructions to Authors” at their website which succinctly states style and
formatting rules. Often style guidelines do not exhaustively address all of the format considerations
faced by an author. If this occurs, the student must arbitrarily choose a format perhaps consulting a
different style guideline then consistently follow that choice for the rest of the document. For
example, what do the chosen style guidelines say in regard to placement of page numbers on
landscaped pages. If the chosen guidelines are silent, then one does not know what is correct. In this
case the student must arbitrarily decide where to place the page number and then place all
subsequent page numbers of landscapes pages consistently in the same location. The font size of
headings, subheadings, etc.Size of symbols and mathematical formula may also vary from 12 pt
where necessary. Exceptions may include inset quotations, footnotes, tabular forms, and the
bibliography, as dictated by the specific style guidelines. Text should be leftjustified and paragraphs
should be tab indented. Without exception, all page numerals should be placed on the top righthand
corner of the page. Page numerals may appear within the 1 inch margins. Typically, default settings
of page numeral placement of word processors are acceptable. The front matter consists of all
sections preceding the narrative and should be numbered using lower case roman numerals. The
first page considered for numbering, though NOT numbered, is the title page. The Acceptance page
is the second page of the document but the first page to be numbered ii.
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